Alison White

From: Alison White

Sent: Friday, December 14, 2018 3:58 PM
To: Jessica Ragland

Cc: Alison White

Subject: FW: FOIA request

Can you help with both of these? Due date 12/21/18. Thanks!

From: Bloomington Normal News <blnnews@yahoo.com>
Sent: Friday, December 14, 2018 3:10 PM

To: Alison White <awhite@normal.org>

Subject: FOIA request

| am requesting the following information under the Freedom of Information Act:
-detailed documentation on the $2000 credit card charge labeled vehicle deposit - Bills for 12/17
-receipts for credit card charge labeled lunch w/Vladimir Delegat. . . in the amount of $330.95
This request is a non-commercial request. | am requesting electronic copies. | am requesting fees be waived
as outlined in the FOI Act as this is a request for public information that is to be shared publicly.
If a waiver of fees is not given then | do request an estimate of the cost be provided prior to filling

the FOIA request.

Diane Benjamin

Virus-free




Rivian
13250 N Haggerty Road |

Plymouth, Michigan
48170

7348554350

ORDER #1130

APPROVED - VISA CREDIT
$2000.00

Visa ending in 0489

AUTH 057233
MID 2322956400
AID A000000003101001
TVR 0080008000
IAD 06010A03A03002
TSI ES00
ARC 5A33
TID 11223344
SOURCE ICC

Verified by Signature
2018-11-14 20:30:26 -0500

This supplemental receipt is provided to customers
who have paid with EMV chip credit cards.
Thank you for your business.






— _iR.I\'IIan Pre-order x 1
Rivian Truck

2 Rivian Pre-order x 1
. 7
Rivian SUV

Subtotal

Shipping

Total

Customer information

Billing address
Chris Koos

Town of Normal, I
11 Uptown Circle
Normal IL 61761

United States

Payment method

VISA payment method — $2,000.00

$1,000.00

$1,000.00

$2,000.00
$0.00

$2,000.00 USD



If you have any guestions, reply to this email or contact us at o






